Approved by CC:
SEP 0 8 2014

REQUEST FOR AGENDA PLACEMENT FORM

Submission Deadline - Tuesday, 12:00 PM before Court Dates

SUBMITTED BY: Ralph McBroom
TODAY'S DATE: September 2,2014

DEPARTMENT: PURCHASING
SIGNATURE OF DEPARTMENT HEAD: Ralph McBroom

REQUESTED AGENDA DATE: September 8, 2014

SPECIFIC AGENDA WORDING: Request court review and approve RFB#2014-422
Asphalt and Asphalt Emulsions to all vendors.

PERSON(S) TO PRESENT ITEM: Ralph McBroom
SUPPORT MATERIAL: Under LGC 262.027 (e) and see attached.

TIME: S minutes ACTIONITEM: _ X

WORKSHOP
(Anticipated number of minutes needed to discuss item) CONSENT:

EXECUTIVE:

STAFF NOTICKE:

COUNTY ATTORNEY: X IT DEPARTMENT:

AUDITOR: PURCHASING DEPARTMENT:

PERSONNEL: PUBLIC WORKS:

BUDGET COORDINATOR: OTHER: Commissioners (4)

kkakkarttr*This Section to be completed by County Judge’s Office* ****&kkss

ASSIGNED AGENDA DATE:

REQUEST RECEIVED BY COUNTY JUDGE'S OFFICE

COURT MEMBER APPROVAL Date




SEEPO(BS. 2044
RFB 2014-422: Asphalt and Asphait Emulsions

Date: 22, 2014 2:00 p.m st Johnson Purchasing Office
Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor _Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor
Western Cleveland Heartland
vend Ergon Asphait | Rooker Asphalt |Crafco Texss Inc. Ermuis} it Asphal Martin Asphait | P2 Emulsion

Pick FOB |PickUp| FOB |PickUp| FOB [PickUp| FOB |Pickup| FOB ..Ean_ FOB IPickUp| FOB |PickUp| FOB
CRS-2 $2.05 [$0 $2.04 | $0.14 | NoBid | NoBid | $2.09 | $2.25 | $2.06 [$2.2836] S2.08[$2.2011] $2.35 $2.60| No Bid | No Bid
06

CRS-2H $2.50 8“58#3.2 $0.21 | NoBid | NoBid | $2.09 | $2.25 | $2.06 [$2.2836] $2.08]$2.2011] No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid

MS-2 $2.60 150.1899] $2.30 | $0.21 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | $2.40 |$2.6636] NoBid | NoBid | $245] $2.70] NoBid | No Bid

HFRS-2 $2.50 190.1899| $2.30 | $0.21 | No Bid | NoBid | $2.50 | $2.69 [NoBid] No8id | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No 8id | No Bid

RC-250 NoBid | NoBid | $4.00 | $0.30 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | $3.75 [$3.9736] No Bid | NoBid | $3.50] $3.75] No Bid | No Bid

ACS No Bid | No Bid | $2.50 | $0.21 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | $3.30 |$3.5236] NoBid | No Bid | $2.55] £2.80] No 8id | No Bid
AC-10 No bid | NoBid | $2.50 | $0.21 | No®id | NoBid | No8id | NoBid | $3.30 [$3.5236] s2.68JS2.8011] 8253 I 'No8id | No Bid
AC-15P 3% Polymer| No Bid | No Bid | NoBid | No Bid | No 8id | No Bid | NoBid | No8id | No 8id| NoBid | $3.35 [s3.4711] $3.10 | $3.35 | No Bid | Mo Bid
>n.Gx_ P2% I Nosid | Nosid | Nosid | No Bid | mosid | Nosid | No Bid | o eid | o 8id| Nomia | $3.30 $3.4211) No Bid | No8id | No Bid | No Bid

MC-30 NoBid | NoBid | $3.75 | $0.40 | NoBid | NoBid | No 8id | No Bid | $4.00 NoBid | NoBid | $3.75 | $4.00 | NoBid | No 8id
CRS-1P NoBid | NoBid | $2.75 | $0.14 | NoBid | NoBid | $2.95 | $3.14 | $2.80 [$3.0236] NoBid | NoBid | No Bid | No Bid | Noid | No 8id
P2Pdme | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No8id | Noid | No Bid | No 8id | No Bid | No Bid| No 8id | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | NoBid | $1.20 | $1.a5

P Prims Ems18! o 8id | No Bid | No 8id | No'Bid | Noid | No id | No eid | mo Bid | No Bt | No etd | No bid | mo sid | Noid | Nopia | 5199 | s226
Diluted AEP | $204 | $.1380| $2.97 | $0.14 $205 | $221 [ o agp] 5200 [$21211

ﬁﬂw“:&n $1.725]$.1389 | $1.68 | $0.14 | NoBid | NoBld | $1.74 | $1.90 $2.50/$2.7235| $1-70 [$1.8211] No 8id | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid

0% H20 40% Product | 5141 | $.1389 | $1.38 | $0.14 $1.42 | s1s8 $1.40 |$1.5211

CWE/CWP2
Emulsified Asphait | 1V° 5'd | No8id | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No8id | $2.06 [$2.2836 No Bid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | $2.74 | $2.99

xs_.o_..ﬂ_ﬁa No8id | No Bid | No Bid | No 8id .e.mo_c_zoaa No Bid | No 8id | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No 8id | No Bid
,_..sau. Per Hour | $50.00 Per Hour .00 Per Hour %Iquxgjsf our | $60.00 Per Hour | $80.00 Per Hour
3._...._3.. afterthe first 2 | after the first 2 after the first 2 | after the first 2 | after the first 2 | afterthe first 2 | after the first 2
our Hours Hours Hours Hours Hours Hours Hours
This bid Is for full 5,000 Gallon
Minimum Order, | | tiosdof | 6,000Gallon | 2250Gallon | 5500Galion SAC0Galion | 5,000 Gallon NoMin| 5080
if Applicable 5,500 Gatlon Minimum Minimum Minimum M __:; Minimum Minimum ™! Gal Min
& Hose
OtherFees | Charge $80.0p | PUmP Charge are 1/2 original

Perioad $1s0.00 fraight




